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Last Week

 God is a jealous God



Today’s Focus

 God lives inside of us

Acts 2:1-4 And when the day of Pentecost was fully come, they were all with one accord in one 
place. And suddenly there came a sound from heaven as of a rushing mighty wind, and it 
filled all the house where they were sitting. And there appeared unto them separated tongues 
like as of fire, and it sat upon each of them. And they were all filled with the Holy Spirit, and 
began to speak with other tongues, as the Spirit gave them utterance. 



Evidence of Faith

Luke 11:13 If you then, being evil, know how to give good gifts unto your children: how much 
more shall your heavenly Father give the Holy Spirit to them that ask him? 

Romans 8:9 But you are not in the flesh, but in the Spirit, if so be that the Spirit of God dwells 
in you. Now if any man have not the Spirit of Christ, he is none of his. 



The Activities of the Holy Spirit

 What does the Holy Spirit do in us?



The Spirit reveals the Truth

John 16:13 But when he, the Spirit of truth, is come, he will guide you into all truth: for he 
shall not speak of himself; but whatsoever he shall hear, that shall he speak: and he will show 
you things to come. 



The Spirit gives us Assurance

Romans 8:16 The Spirit himself bears witness with our spirit, that we are the children of God: 



The Holy Spirit Guides

John 10:27 My sheep hear my voice, and I know them, and they follow me: 

Romans 8:14 For as many as are led by the Spirit of God, they are the sons of God. 



The Spirit teaches us how to pray

Romans 8:26 Likewise the Spirit also helps our weakness:for we know not what we should 
pray for as we ought but the Spirit himself makes intercession for us with groanings which 
cannot be uttered. 



The Spirit convicts of sin

John 16:7-8 Nevertheless I tell you the truth; It is expedient for you that I go away: for if I go 
not away, the Comforter will not come unto you; but if I depart, I will send him unto you. And 
when he is come, he will convict the world of sin, and of righteousness, and of judgment: 



The Holy Spirit Comforts

John 16:7-8 Nevertheless I tell you the truth; It is expedient for you that I go away: for if I go 
not away, the Comforter will not come unto you; but if I depart, I will send him unto you. And 
when he is come, he will convict the world of sin, and of righteousness, and of judgment: 



The Spirit reveals God’s Love

Romans 5:5 And hope makes not ashamed; because the love of God is shed abroad in our 
hearts by the Holy Spirit who is given unto us. 



The Fruit of the Holy Spirit

Galatians 5:22-23 But the fruit of the Spirit is love, joy, peace, longsuffering, gentleness, 
goodness, faith, Meekness, self-control: against such there is no law. 



The Gifts of the Spirit

1 Corinthians 12:4-8 Now there are diversities of gifts, but the same Spirit. And there are 
differences of ministries, but the same Lord. And there are diversities of workings, but it is the 
same God who works all in all. But the manifestation of the Spirit is given to every man for 
profit. For to one is given by the Spirit the word of wisdom; to another the word of knowledge 
by the same Spirit; …



What should we do?

Acts 2:38 Then Peter said unto them, Repent, and be baptized every one of you in the name of 
Jesus Christ for the remission of sins, and you shall receive the gift of the Holy Spirit. 



The Day of Pentecost 

 Let’s make Pentecost personal


